TOWN OF PLAINFIELD
ﬁ\q} ZONING AND BUILDING PERMIT
APPLICATION

Property Owner:
Name: | (2, Phone: | 3e/
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Proposed project distances to property lines (in feet):  front: (3> Rear Side: {j’;‘de‘ 0
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2

Please provide a / { 7
written description of 3 (9 >< C( O m‘f%/’zﬁ 6\4? M{_}L)
the project including

appropriate
dimensions:

Contractor Information:

Builder: Electrician: Plumber:

Name: L\ a&.)“b-&‘ Name: Name:;
12

Phone: l \ Phone: Phone: |

/ /
Applicant Slgnaturex(/ / Jb’/ Date:

Required Attachments D%p off or mail Application documents to: Town of Plainficld, PO Box 380, Meriden, NH 03770

Please provide a copy of plans detailing the project. Hand-drawn plans can be used if necessary.
Permits cannot be issued without receipt of the proper fee. If you are unsure of the amount due or have any questions about your
application, contact the town office (603-469-3201). email address: plainficld.ta@plainfieldnh.org

TOWN USE:

Current Usé: Yes\/No ZBA: Yes /No PB: Yes/No
il . P A 2
TOWN Of PLAINF IELD ACT'ON Reviewed and Approvecery ;ulldmgémpector
) =D [
Approved __ Denied RL.y:e;w_ejL Zomrbé Administrator
permit #:_2020-57 Date_10-05-2020




PERMIT RENEWAL
REQUEST

DATE: September 16, 2021

Permit Status (Permit or Renewal valid for one year from issue date)
Must be renewed within 30 days of expiration or a new permit must be applied for.
Permit # 2020-57 | ssued: 10-05-2020
X RENEWAL REQUIRED BY: 10-05-2021
NO INSPECTION REQUESTED
X LAST INSPECTION:  10-04-2020

X YOUR PERMIT REQUIRED INSPECTIONS PER INSPECTION
GUIDELINES.

X RETURN THIS FORM WITH RENEWAL FEE TO TOWN HALL.

A CERTIFICATE OF OCCUPANCY WAS REQUIRED PRIOR TO
OCCUPYIING YOUR HOUSE

X A CERTIFICATE OF COMPLETION WAS REQUIRED

NAME:  Chris Jewell
ADDRESS: 65 Whitaker Road
Plainfield, NH 03781

MAP; 252 LOT: 09.2 ADDRESS: Same

David H Lersch 603-381-1929
Plainfield Building Inspector

cc. Town files



Chris & Amanda Jewell
PO Box 414

Meriden

469-3137

Permit # 2020

Map/Lot 252/9.2
garage

65 Whitaker Road

09-30-20 Talked to Chris, said he sent permit in, Steve didn't have and never was sent to me. He
already has the footer poured. He dropped off another permit to Steve, still don't have. He doesn't have
any plans, just size and may have Lavalley do trusses. | told him | needed some drawings and
information and will need truss specifications. A CO was issued on the house 06/25/14, no inspections
for attached garage except footer and frost wall on house permit 2013-61.

Time 0.1

10-03-20 emails

Was there 445 and inspected footer, size looks good, no ground wire coming out of
footer as | assume you will have electricity. No way to connect ground wire as no rebar
stub up either.

Dave

---------- Original Message ----------

From: Chris Jewell <chris@jewellspecialized.com>

To: David Lersch <davejosie@juno.com>

Subject: Re: Garage

Date: Sat, 3 Oct 2020 08:46:14 -0400

What time will you be here today?A | will be here until 11:30 this morning. And will be
back around 4 today.A

On Fri, Oct 2, 2020 at 6:55 PM David Lersch <davejosie@juno.com> wrote:
Chris,

No additional work can be done until permit application and drawings received with fee
and approved by me.

Will stop by tomorrow to see site. | will need

Pictures of footer before pouring or detail about forms, size, rebar, how rebar was
installed.

David H Lersch
Plainfield Building Inspector

Chris Jewell, President A Jewell Specialized, IncA
603-381-9897 Cell phone

10-04-20 | went to inspect the footer. Width and depth okay, contractor said rebar installed as well
as Chris. No rebar stub or ground wire installed.

~ A



	TextBox0: Chris & Amanda Jewell
PO Box 414
Meriden
469-3137
Permit # 2020
Map/Lot 252/9.2
garage
65 Whitaker Road


09-30-20 Talked to Chris, said he sent permit in, Steve didn't have and never was sent to me. He already has the footer poured. He dropped off another permit to Steve, still don't have. He doesn't have any plans, just size and may have Lavalley do trusses. I told him I needed some drawings and information and will need truss specifications. A CO was issued on the house 06/25/14, no inspections for attached garage except footer and frost wall on house permit 2013-61.
Time 0.1

-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
10-03-20 emails
Was there 445 and inspected footer, size looks good, no ground wire coming out of 
footer as I assume you will have electricity. No way to connect ground wire as no rebar 
stub up either.
Dave
---------- Original Message ----------
From: Chris Jewell <chris@jewellspecialized.com>
To: David Lersch <davejosie@juno.com>
Subject: Re: Garage
Date: Sat, 3 Oct 2020 08:46:14 -0400

What time will you be here today?Â I will be here until 11:30 this morning. And will be 
back around 4 today.Â 

On Fri, Oct 2, 2020 at 6:55 PM David Lersch <davejosie@juno.com> wrote:
Chris,

No additional work can be done until permit application and drawings received with fee 
and approved by me.

Will stop by tomorrow to see site. I will need

Pictures of footer before pouring or detail about forms, size, rebar, how rebar was 
installed.

David H Lersch

Plainfield Building Inspector 

Chris Jewell, President Â Jewell Specialized, IncÂ 
603-381-9897 Cell phone
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------

10-04-20 I went to inspect the footer. Width and depth okay, contractor said rebar installed as well 
                as Chris. No rebar stub or ground wire installed.
                Time 0.6

10-05-20  Chris said to be there around 1PM, went there, forms were up for the walls they were going
                 to pour today, rebar not installed yet. Sent a text to Chris, he said do 2:30.
                 Time 0.4

10-05-20  Contractor was there and was installing rebar, we discussed project, not enough panels to
                 do all the way around and was going to do a keyway joint to join the next wall pour. He sent           
                 text pictures with all rebar installed.
                 Time 0.3

10-01-2020
 Hey Chris and Amanda

 

The building permit for the new garage will cost $122 please send a check to TOP PO Box 380 Meriden or drop it off at town hall.

 

The building inspector will need some sort of plans and material list for the garage.  If LaValleys is dong the trusts include their specification sheet in whatever you give David.

 

Finally,  there is only one acre of land out of current use for your house, so based on where you indicated the garage will be, the new garage will trigger a current use penalty (likely in the hundreds not thousands of dollars).  Please amend the attached map to show me where the new garage will be located and what lands you need to remove from current use to support the building. The area in pink shows land currently out of current use to support your home.

 

Once we have these things we can go ahead and process your building permit.

 

 

Stephen Halleran

Town Administrator

(603) 469-3201
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